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Do more in less time!
 
Whether you’re an entrepreneur, accountant, or bookkeeper, this comprehensive guide will help you get the
most out of QuickBooks 2014: more productivity, more business knowledge, and more value! Drawing on
her unsurpassed QuickBooks consulting and accounting experience, Laura Madeira delivers quickstart
instructions plus step-by-step guides and practical checklists for taking total control over business finances.
With Quickbooks and this book at your disposal, you’ll improve everything from planning to reporting and
payroll to invoicing.
 

Create a new QuickBooks file; convert from other software; and set up users, permissions, and preferences●

Expanded! Learn how to use tools specific to your version of QuickBooks, including QuickBooks●

Enterprise Solutions
Understand QuickBooks lists from the chart of accounts, items, classes, and more●

Set up and manage inventory, vendors, customers, and payroll●

Track product or service sales and manage the profitability of your company●

Efficiently use Bank Feeds to download bank and credit card transactions●

Master all the essentials of financial reporting; customize and memorize reports●

Review the accuracy of your data, with step-by-step instructions accompanied by checklists●

Share QuickBooks data with your accountant or client at tax time●

Use QuickBooks 2014’s tools for managing loans, planning and preparing for year-end, and syncing with●

Outlook contacts
Efficiently review and correct client data errors, from misclassified transactions to incorrect beginning●

balances
Prepare customized reports and documents using MS Excel and Word integration●

Master powerful shortcuts for working more efficiently and saving precious time●

Learn how to reliably back up your data, troubleshoot database errors, and manage QuickBooks data●

integrity

All In Depth books offer
 

Comprehensive coverage with detailed solutions●

Troubleshooting help for tough problems you can’t fix on your own●

Outstanding authors recognized worldwide for their expertise and teaching style●

Learning, reference, problem-solving...the only QuickBooks 2014 book you need!
 
Register your book at quepublishing.com/register
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From reader reviews:

Theodore Stewart:

Have you spare time for just a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Sure, you
can choose the suitable activity for spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a go
walking, shopping, or went to typically the Mall. How about open or maybe read a book eligible
QuickBooks 2014 In Depth? Maybe it is to be best activity for you. You know beside you can spend your
time with your favorite's book, you can better than before. Do you agree with their opinion or you have
various other opinion?

Mary Salas:

Spent a free a chance to be fun activity to complete! A lot of people spent their free time with their family, or
all their friends. Usually they doing activity like watching television, planning to beach, or picnic inside
park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Will you something different to fill your own
free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book can be option to fill your free of charge time/ holiday. The first
thing you will ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you want to attempt look for
book, may be the e-book untitled QuickBooks 2014 In Depth can be great book to read. May be it is usually
best activity to you.

Lynn Lambert:

Reading a book being new life style in this year; every people loves to examine a book. When you go
through a book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your
knowledge, mainly because book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend
on what sorts of book that you have read. If you wish to get information about your examine, you can read
education books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this sort of us
novel, comics, and also soon. The QuickBooks 2014 In Depth provide you with new experience in reading
through a book.

Pierre Winter:

You are able to spend your free time to see this book this publication. This QuickBooks 2014 In Depth is
simple to develop you can read it in the area, in the beach, train and soon. If you did not get much space to
bring typically the printed book, you can buy typically the e-book. It is make you easier to read it. You can
save the particular book in your smart phone. So there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy
this book.
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