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A tentative peace between Israel and Palestine has been brokered by the United States. But the Taskforce—a
clandestine team operating outside of US law to protect the country from terrorism—hears of an
assassination attempt on the American envoy sent to solidify the treaty. The Taskforce must devote every
resource to saving his life—and preventing another bloody outbreak of violence.

Taskforce operator Pike Logan and his partner, Jennifer Cahill, must hunt down the assassin through the
Middle East, following a trail that becomes more perilous at every turn. And they must deal with terrorist
organizations, independent killers, and shaky allies to uncover the biggest threat of all: an American citizen
hiding a secret that just may destroy everything, including the Taskforce.
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From reader reviews:

Edward Olivieri:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important work, like
looking for your favorite reserve and reading a publication. Beside you can solve your trouble; you can add
your knowledge by the guide entitled Enemy of Mine: A Pike Logan Thriller. Try to the actual book Enemy
of Mine: A Pike Logan Thriller as your good friend. It means that it can for being your friend when you truly
feel alone and beside associated with course make you smarter than before. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your
case. The book makes you a lot more confidence because you can know almost everything by the book. So ,
let's make new experience along with knowledge with this book.

Mary Benoit:

Now a day people that Living in the era where everything reachable by connect to the internet and the
resources inside can be true or not call for people to be aware of each info they get. How a lot more to be
smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Reading through a
book can help individuals out of this uncertainty Information specially this Enemy of Mine: A Pike Logan
Thriller book as this book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the details in this book hundred per
cent guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Joseph Chitwood:

The book Enemy of Mine: A Pike Logan Thriller will bring you to the new experience of reading the book.
The author style to elucidate the idea is very unique. When you try to find new book you just read, this book
very ideal to you. The book Enemy of Mine: A Pike Logan Thriller is much recommended to you you just
read. You can also get the e-book from official web site, so you can quicker to read the book.

Karen Bright:

Many people spending their period by playing outside having friends, fun activity along with family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by examining a book. Ugh,
do you think reading a book can really hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It all right you
can have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Enemy of Mine: A Pike
Logan Thriller which is getting the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's view.
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