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In America, notes acclaimed novelist Francine Prose, we are obsessed with food and diet. And what is this
obsession with food except a struggle between sin and virtue, overeating and self-control--a struggle with the
fierce temptations of gluttony.
In Gluttony, Francine Prose serves up a marvelous banquet of witty and engaging observations on this most
delicious of deadly sins. She traces how our notions of gluttony have evolved along with our ideas about
salvation and damnation, health and illness, life and death. Offering a lively smorgasbord that ranges from
Augustine's Confessions and Chaucer's Pardoner's Tale, to Petronius's Satyricon and Dante's Inferno, she
shows that gluttony was in medieval times a deeply spiritual matter, but today we have transformed gluttony
from a sin into an illness--it is the horrors of cholesterol and the perils of red meat that we demonize. Indeed,
the modern take on gluttony is that we overeat out of compulsion, self-destructiveness, or to avoid intimacy
and social contact. But gluttony, Prose reminds us, is also an affirmation of pleasure and of passion. She ends
the book with a discussion of M.F.K. Fisher's idiosyncratic defense of one of the great heroes of gluttony,
Diamond Jim Brady, whose stomach was six times normal size.
"The broad, shiny face of the glutton," Prose writes, "has been--and continues to be--the mirror in which we
see ourselves, our hopes and fears, our darkest dreams and deepest desires." Never have we delved more
deeply into this mirror than in this insightful and stimulating book.
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From reader reviews:

Emily Carey:

This Gluttony (The Seven Deadly Sins) tend to be reliable for you who want to be considered a successful
person, why. The reason of this Gluttony (The Seven Deadly Sins) can be one of several great books you
must have is giving you more than just simple studying food but feed anyone with information that maybe
will shock your preceding knowledge. This book is actually handy, you can bring it all over the place and
whenever your conditions throughout the e-book and printed kinds. Beside that this Gluttony (The Seven
Deadly Sins) forcing you to have an enormous of experience for instance rich vocabulary, giving you trial
run of critical thinking that we all know it useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it and luxuriate in
reading.

Jorge Eaton:

Precisely why? Because this Gluttony (The Seven Deadly Sins) is an unordinary book that the inside of the
publication waiting for you to snap it but latter it will zap you with the secret the item inside. Reading this
book close to it was fantastic author who have write the book in such remarkable way makes the content on
the inside easier to understand, entertaining way but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is good for you
because of not hesitating having this anymore or you going to regret it. This excellent book will give you a
lot of gains than the other book include such as help improving your skill and your critical thinking way. So ,
still want to hold off having that book? If I ended up you I will go to the publication store hurriedly.

Wanda Sousa:

Do you really one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt when you find yourself in the book
store? Make an effort to pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't assess book by its
include may doesn't work the following is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not
seeing that fantastic as in the outside appear likes. Maybe you answer may be Gluttony (The Seven Deadly
Sins) why because the great cover that make you consider regarding the content will not disappoint anyone.
The inside or content is fantastic as the outside or perhaps cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly direct
you to pick up this book.

John Gravatt:

Is it an individual who having spare time subsequently spend it whole day through watching television
programs or just laying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Gluttony (The Seven Deadly
Sins) can be the solution, oh how comes? A book you know. You are thus out of date, spending your spare
time by reading in this brand-new era is common not a geek activity. So what these guides have than the
others?
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