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What Experts Say:

"A clever and fun way to teach your kids the true value of money." -Jen Singer, author of You're a Good
Mom (and Your Kids Aren't So Bad, Either)

"Great concept, great lessons, and every family can implement these ideas." -Lori Mackey, founder of
Prosperity4Kids.com

"The Earn My Keep philosophy is so creative and innovative and I love the message it promotes: that hard
work and money earned have value-a notion that seems to have lost its strength for our youth over the past
couple decades." -Allison K. Chase, PhD, clinical psychologist specializing in children, adolescents, and
families

"Addresses the sense of entitlement that so many of today's children have by instilling a sense of
responsibility for their own wealth and career choices through creative play." -Susan Heim, coauthor/editor,
Chicken Soup for the Soul series

The easy-to-do twist on traditional allowance that's wowing parents across the country!

The program featured in Earn It, Learn It is the only one that lets kids ages four through twelve earn by
doing "real" jobs. Your child will learn from folks like a:

Toy Designer from Crayola●

Curator from the Rock and Roll Hall of Fame and Museum●

Zoologist from the Saint Louis Zoo●

Teach your kid the difference between making the bed as a member of the family and earning a living in the
real world. Expose your child to art, manners, math, and more. And build a foundation for a lifelong love of
learning and fiscal independence.

All while having fun!
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From reader reviews:

Thomas Lemos:

In other case, little people like to read book Earn It, Learn It: Teach Your Child the Value of Money, Work,
and Time Well Spent (Earn My Keep Allowance Program). You can choose the best book if you appreciate
reading a book. Provided that we know about how is important the book Earn It, Learn It: Teach Your Child
the Value of Money, Work, and Time Well Spent (Earn My Keep Allowance Program). You can add
understanding and of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right, simply because from
book you can understand everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you will end up
known. About simple matter until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this era, we could open a
book or even searching by internet product. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel bored stiff to
go to the library. Let's go through.

Jeffery Herring:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be upgrade about what going on or information even
knowledge to make all of them keep up with the era and that is always change and move ahead. Some of you
maybe will probably update themselves by reading through books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but
the problems coming to a person is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Earn It, Learn It:
Teach Your Child the Value of Money, Work, and Time Well Spent (Earn My Keep Allowance Program) is
our recommendation to make you keep up with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and wish
in this era.

Gary Johnson:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information these days can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a expertise or any news even a concern. What people must be consider
if those information which is in the former life are challenging to be find than now's taking seriously which
one is acceptable to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you obtain the unstable
resource then you get it as your main information it will have huge disadvantage for you. All those
possibilities will not happen with you if you take Earn It, Learn It: Teach Your Child the Value of Money,
Work, and Time Well Spent (Earn My Keep Allowance Program) as the daily resource information.

Patricia Howland:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always attempt to and must have the free time or they will get
wide range of stress from both way of life and work. So , if we ask do people have spare time, we will say
absolutely sure. People is human not really a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity do you have
when the spare time coming to you actually of course your answer will unlimited right. Then do you ever try
this one, reading books. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, the actual book you
have read is Earn It, Learn It: Teach Your Child the Value of Money, Work, and Time Well Spent (Earn My



Keep Allowance Program).
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