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Hay que leerlo manos arriba. Su peligrosidad se funda en la sabiduria solapada y la belleza mortifera de la
falta de seriedad. Gabriel Garcia Marquez Se presenta aqui una cuidada antologia que pretende trazar un
camino de ida y vuelta sobre la obra de Augusto Monterroso, amigo de las cosas ironicamente simples y
maxima figura del genero mas breve de la literatura: el microrrelato. Articulado en dos bloques
complementarios, el volumen recoge los cuentos y ensayos mas representativos del autor, y nos proporciona
un viaje a la felicidad y a la sencillez, a la gracia y a la discrecion, al humorismo y a la tristeza. Un timido
homenaje al mas refinado de los escritores hispanoamericanos.
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From reader reviews:

David Wysocki:

Book is actually written, printed, or descriptive for everything. You can learn everything you want by a
book. Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important point to bring us around the world.
Close to that you can your reading ability was fluently. A publication El paraíso imperfecto / The imperfect
paradise: Antología tímida / Shy Anthology (Spanish Edition) will make you to end up being smarter. You
can feel considerably more confidence if you can know about everything. But some of you think this open or
reading a new book make you bored. It is far from make you fun. Why they are often thought like that? Have
you looking for best book or suited book with you?

Amy Lewis:

In this 21st one hundred year, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive today, people
have do something to make these individuals survives, being in the middle of the particular crowded place
and notice by means of surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated this for a
while is reading. Yes, by reading a guide your ability to survive enhance then having chance to endure than
other is high. To suit your needs who want to start reading the book, we give you this specific El paraíso
imperfecto / The imperfect paradise: Antología tímida / Shy Anthology (Spanish Edition) book as basic and
daily reading e-book. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Teresa Dawkins:

Beside this kind of El paraíso imperfecto / The imperfect paradise: Antología tímida / Shy Anthology
(Spanish Edition) in your phone, it may give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or facts. The
information and the knowledge you might got here is fresh from the oven so don't always be worry if you
feel like an older people live in narrow village. It is good thing to have El paraíso imperfecto / The imperfect
paradise: Antología tímida / Shy Anthology (Spanish Edition) because this book offers to your account
readable information. Do you sometimes have book but you would not get what it's all about. Oh come on,
that would not happen if you have this in your hand. The Enjoyable blend here cannot be questionable, like
treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to miss the item? Find this book and read it from now!

Mary Fox:

On this era which is the greater particular person or who has ability to do something more are more precious
than other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple method to have that. What you have
to do is just spending your time little but quite enough to possess a look at some books. One of several books
in the top list in your reading list is El paraíso imperfecto / The imperfect paradise: Antología tímida / Shy
Anthology (Spanish Edition). This book and that is qualified as The Hungry Hillsides can get you closer in
becoming precious person. By looking up and review this reserve you can get many advantages.
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