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Flaxseed- Miraculous Anti-ageing Divine Food What is Flaxseed and how can it benefit me? I was faced
with this question when I started hearing about Flaxseed not long ago. It became a ‘buzz word’ in society
and seems to be making great role in increased health for many. I wanted to join that wagon of wellness and
so I researched until I felt satisfied that it could help me, too. Here are my findings. Flaxseeds are the hard,
tiny seeds of Linum usitatissimum, the flax plant, which has been widely used for thousands of years as a
source of food and clothing. Flaxseeds have become very popular recently, because they are a richest source
of the Omega 3 essential fatty acid; also known as Alpha Linolenic Acid (ALA) and lignans. People in the
new millennium may see flaxseed as an important new FOOD SUPER STAR. In fact, there’s nobody who
won’t benefit by adding flaxseed to his or her diet. Even Gandhi wrote: “Wherever flaxseed becomes a
regular food item among the people, there will be better health.” Flaxseed contains 30-40% oil (including
36-50% alpha linolenic acid, 23-24% linoleic acid- Omega-6 fatty acids and oleic acids), mucilage (6%),
protein (25%), Vitamin B group, lecithin, selenium, calcium, folate, magnesium, zinc, iron, carotene, sulfur,
potassium, phosphorous, manganese, silicon, copper, nickel, molybdenum, chromium, and cobalt, vitamins
A and E and all essential amino acids. Other fatty acids, omega-6’s, is abundant in vegetable oils such as
corn, soybean, safflower, and sunflower oils as well as in the many processed foods made from these oils.
Omega-6 fatty acids have stimulating, irritating and inflammatory effect while omega-3 fatty acids have
calming and soothing effect on our body. Our bodies function best when our diets contain a well-balanced
ratio of these fatty acids, meaning 1:1 to 4:1 of omega-6 and omega-3. But we typically eat 10 to 30 times
more omega-6’s than omega-3’s, which is a prescription for trouble. This imbalance puts us at greater risk
for a number of serious illnesses, including heart disease, cancer, stroke, and arthritis. As the most abundant
plant source of omega-3 fatty acids, flaxseed helps restore balance and lets omega-3’s do what they’re best
at: balancing the immune system, decreasing inflammation, and lowering some of the risk factors for heart
disease. One way that Omega 3 essential fatty acid known as Alpha Linolenic Acid ALA helps the heart is
by decreasing the ability of platelets to clump together. Flax seed helps to lower high blood pressure, clears
clogged coronaries, lowers high blood cholesterol, bad LDL cholesterol and triglyceride levels and raises
good HDL cholesterol. It can relieve the symptoms of Diabetes Mellitus. It lowers blood sugar level.
Flaxseed help fight obesity. Adding flaxseed to foods creates a feeling of satiation. Furthermore, flaxseed
stokes the metabolic processes in our cells. Much like a furnace, once stoked, the cells generate more heat
and burn calories. Flaxseeds are the most abundant source of lignans. Lignans are plant-based compounds
that can block estrogen activity in cells, reducing the risk of Breast, Uterus, Colon and Prostate cancers.
According to the US Department of Agriculture, flaxseed contains 27 identifiable cancer preventative
compounds. Lignans in flaxseeds are 200 to 800 times more than any other lignan source. Lignans are
phytoestrogens, meaning that they are similar to but weaker than the estrogen that a woman’s body produces
naturally. Therefore, they may also help alleviate menopausal discomforts such as hot flashes and vaginal
dryness. They are also antibacterial, antifungal, and antiviral. Because they are high in dietary fiber, ground
flaxseeds can help ease the passage of stools and thus relieve constipation, hemorrhoids and diverticular
disease. Taken for inflammatory bowel disease, flaxseed can help to calm inflammation and repair any
intestinal tract damage.
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From reader reviews:

Lacie Young:

What do you regarding book? It is not important along with you? Or just adding material when you want
something to explain what your own problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy person? If you
don't have spare time to perform others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have extra time?
What did you do? Everyone has many questions above. The doctor has to answer that question mainly
because just their can do which. It said that about publication. Book is familiar on every person. Yes, it is
right. Because start from on kindergarten until university need that Awesome Flax: A Book by Flax Guru to
read.

Katrina Roberts:

Here thing why that Awesome Flax: A Book by Flax Guru are different and reliable to be yours. First of all
studying a book is good nevertheless it depends in the content from it which is the content is as delightful as
food or not. Awesome Flax: A Book by Flax Guru giving you information deeper since different ways, you
can find any e-book out there but there is no reserve that similar with Awesome Flax: A Book by Flax Guru.
It gives you thrill examining journey, its open up your eyes about the thing this happened in the world which
is perhaps can be happened around you. You can actually bring everywhere like in playground, café, or even
in your technique home by train. If you are having difficulties in bringing the imprinted book maybe the
form of Awesome Flax: A Book by Flax Guru in e-book can be your alternate.

Kenneth Hill:

The e-book untitled Awesome Flax: A Book by Flax Guru is the publication that recommended to you you
just read. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown to anyone. The language that
writer use to explained their way of doing something is easily to understand. The author was did a lot of
analysis when write the book, and so the information that they share to you is absolutely accurate. You also
could possibly get the e-book of Awesome Flax: A Book by Flax Guru from the publisher to make you
considerably more enjoy free time.

James Baker:

You may spend your free time to see this book this reserve. This Awesome Flax: A Book by Flax Guru is
simple to deliver you can read it in the recreation area, in the beach, train and soon. If you did not have much
space to bring the printed book, you can buy often the e-book. It is make you better to read it. You can save
often the book in your smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you will get when you buy
this book.
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