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Beautifully illustrated as well as informative, One Hundred & One Beautiful Towns in France: Food and
Wine explores the local delicacies of a country known for and proud of its love of food and wine. Organized
by region, this book features a wonderful sampling of French plaisirs de la table and the shops and markets
where you can find them. The classic dishes and drink of France are as remarkably varied as its many
different regions: Quench your thirst with a glass of calvados, the heady apple brandy that Normandy is
known for; reach "land’s end" or Finistère, in Brittany, and enjoy a galette, a savory buckwheat crêpe stuffed
with ham and cheese or mushrooms and lobster; don’t miss the vendange (harvest) in romantic Burgundy or
a simple, hearty meal of boeuf bourguignon; in scenic Alsace enjoy a piping-hot flammekueche, a tart of
local cheeses, speck, and onions. A thorough appendix provides useful addresses and phone numbers to
accommodate planning your trip, including hotel listings, restaurants, wineries, and shops. Sidebars give
information on local delicacies to be tasted and imbibed, as well as where to find the choicest goods.
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From reader reviews:

Kenneth Tillman:

Have you spare time for any day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yes, you
can choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their spare time to take a
go walking, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open as well as read a book allowed One Hundred and
One Beautiful Towns in France: Food & Wine? Maybe it is for being best activity for you. You already
know beside you can spend your time with your favorite's book, you can more intelligent than before. Do
you agree with the opinion or you have different opinion?

Ann Davis:

Nowadays reading books become more and more than want or need but also work as a life style. This
reading routine give you lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the actual
information inside the book this improve your knowledge and information. The knowledge you get based on
what kind of e-book you read, if you want attract knowledge just go with knowledge books but if you want
really feel happy read one together with theme for entertaining for instance comic or novel. The particular
One Hundred and One Beautiful Towns in France: Food & Wine is kind of book which is giving the reader
capricious experience.

Athena Thornton:

This One Hundred and One Beautiful Towns in France: Food & Wine tend to be reliable for you who want
to certainly be a successful person, why. The explanation of this One Hundred and One Beautiful Towns in
France: Food & Wine can be among the great books you must have is giving you more than just simple
reading through food but feed an individual with information that perhaps will shock your previous
knowledge. This book is usually handy, you can bring it everywhere you go and whenever your conditions
throughout the e-book and printed versions. Beside that this One Hundred and One Beautiful Towns in
France: Food & Wine forcing you to have an enormous of experience like rich vocabulary, giving you demo
of critical thinking that we all know it useful in your day exercise. So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Nancy Thornton:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind ability or
thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book compared to
can satisfy your short time to read it because this time you only find book that need more time to be study.
One Hundred and One Beautiful Towns in France: Food & Wine can be your answer because it can be read
by you who have those short extra time problems.
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