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Steel Magnolias meets The Help in this Southern debut novel sparkling with humor, heart, and
feminine wisdom

Twelve-year-old CeeCee Honeycutt is in trouble. For years, she has been the caretaker of her psychotic
mother, Camille-the tiara-toting, lipstick-smeared laughingstock of an entire town-a woman trapped in her
long-ago moment of glory as the 1951 Vidalia Onion Queen. But when Camille is hit by a truck and killed,
CeeCee is left to fend for herself. To the rescue comes her previously unknown great-aunt, Tootie Caldwell.

In her vintage Packard convertible, Tootie whisks CeeCee away to Savannah's perfumed world of prosperity
and Southern eccentricity, a world that seems to be run entirely by women. From the exotic Miz Thelma Rae
Goodpepper, who bathes in her backyard bathtub and uses garden slugs as her secret weapons, to Tootie's
all-knowing housekeeper, Oletta Jones, to Violene Hobbs, who entertains a local police officer in her canary-
yellow peignoir, the women of Gaston Street keep CeeCee entertained and enthralled for an entire summer.

Laugh-out-loud funny and deeply touching, Beth Hoffman's sparkling debut is, as Kristin Hannah says,
"packed full of Southern charm, strong women, wacky humor, and good old-fashioned heart." It is a novel
that explores the indomitable strengths of female friendship and gives us the story of a young girl who loses
one mother and finds many others.
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From reader reviews:

Jaleesa Greenwood:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important act, like looking
for your favorite reserve and reading a book. Beside you can solve your short lived problem; you can add
your knowledge by the reserve entitled Saving CeeCee Honeycutt: A Novel. Try to stumble through book
Saving CeeCee Honeycutt: A Novel as your buddy. It means that it can being your friend when you feel
alone and beside that of course make you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is very fortuned in your case. The
book makes you more confidence because you can know every little thing by the book. So , let's make new
experience and also knowledge with this book.

Ellen Garcia:

Throughout other case, little folks like to read book Saving CeeCee Honeycutt: A Novel. You can choose the
best book if you like reading a book. Provided that we know about how is important the book Saving CeeCee
Honeycutt: A Novel. You can add know-how and of course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely
right, because from book you can know everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you may be
known. About simple thing until wonderful thing you are able to know that. In this era, we could open a
book or perhaps searching by internet device. It is called e-book. You can utilize it when you feel bored to go
to the library. Let's study.

Helen Kingsbury:

A lot of people always spent their own free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them friends
and family or their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV,
or maybe playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity honestly, that is look
different you can read the book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent the
whole day to reading a e-book. The book Saving CeeCee Honeycutt: A Novel it is extremely good to read.
There are a lot of those who recommended this book. These folks were enjoying reading this book. If you did
not have enough space to bring this book you can buy often the e-book. You can m0ore quickly to read this
book from a smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book features high quality.

Paul Day:

Don't be worry if you are afraid that this book will filled the space in your house, you could have it in e-book
approach, more simple and reachable. This particular Saving CeeCee Honeycutt: A Novel can give you a lot
of close friends because by you checking out this one book you have issue that they don't and make you
actually more like an interesting person. That book can be one of one step for you to get success. This book
offer you information that probably your friend doesn't understand, by knowing more than additional make
you to be great men and women. So , why hesitate? Let us have Saving CeeCee Honeycutt: A Novel.
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