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Jazz in New Orleans provides accurate information about, and an insightful interpretation of, jazz in New
Orleans from the end of World War II through 1970. Suhor, relying on his experiences as a listener, a
working jazz drummer, and writer in New Orleans during this period, has done a great service to lovers of
New Orleans music by filling in some gaping holes in postwar jazz history and cutting through many of the
myths and misconceptions that have taken hold over the years. Skillfully combining his personal experiences
and historical research, the author writes with both authority and immediacy.

The text, rich in previously unpublished anecdotes and New Orleans lore, is divided into three sections, each
with an overview essay followed by pertinent articles Suhor wrote for national and local journals?including
Down Beat and New Orleans Magazine. Section One, "Jazz and the Establishment," focuses on cultural and
institutional settings in which jazz was first battered, then nurtured. It deals with the reluctance of power
brokers and the custodians of culture in New Orleans to accept jazz as art until the music proved itself
elsewhere and was easily recognizable as a marketable commodity. Section Two, "Traditional and Dixieland
Jazz," highlights the music and the musicians who were central to early jazz styles in New Orleans between
1947 and 1953. Section Three, "An Invisible Generation," will help dispel the stubborn myth that almost no
one was playing be-bop or other modern jazz styles in New Orleans before the current generation of young
artists appeared in the 1980s.
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From reader reviews:

Woodrow Harker:

Often the book Jazz in New Orleans: The Postwar Years Through 1970 (Studies in Jazz) will bring someone
to the new experience of reading some sort of book. The author style to spell out the idea is very unique. If
you try to find new book you just read, this book very acceptable to you. The book Jazz in New Orleans: The
Postwar Years Through 1970 (Studies in Jazz) is much recommended to you to learn. You can also get the e-
book from official web site, so you can more readily to read the book.

James Williams:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with close friends is thing
that usually you have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try thing that really
opposite from that. One particular activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like
on roller coaster you have been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Jazz in New
Orleans: The Postwar Years Through 1970 (Studies in Jazz), you can enjoy both. It is very good combination
right, you still want to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh occur its mind hangout people. What?
Still don't buy it, oh come on its named reading friends.

Helen Velez:

Jazz in New Orleans: The Postwar Years Through 1970 (Studies in Jazz) can be one of your nice books that
are good idea. All of us recommend that straight away because this reserve has good vocabulary that can
increase your knowledge in vocabulary, easy to understand, bit entertaining but delivering the information.
The writer giving his/her effort that will put every word into pleasure arrangement in writing Jazz in New
Orleans: The Postwar Years Through 1970 (Studies in Jazz) but doesn't forget the main position, giving the
reader the hottest in addition to based confirm resource data that maybe you can be one among it. This great
information may drawn you into completely new stage of crucial contemplating.

Silvia Doucet:

Reading a book to be new life style in this season; every people loves to read a book. When you examine a
book you can get a wide range of benefit. When you read textbooks, you can improve your knowledge,
because book has a lot of information upon it. The information that you will get depend on what types of
book that you have read. If you would like get information about your analysis, you can read education
books, but if you act like you want to entertain yourself you can read a fiction books, this kind of us novel,
comics, along with soon. The Jazz in New Orleans: The Postwar Years Through 1970 (Studies in Jazz)
provide you with a new experience in looking at a book.
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