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William Henry Devereaux, Jr., spiritually suited to playing left field but forced by a bad hamstring to try first
base, is the unlikely chairman of the English department at West Central Pennsylvania University. Over the
course of a single convoluted week, he threatens to execute a duck, has his nose slashed by a feminist poet,
discovers that his secretary writes better fiction than he does, suspects his wife of having an affair with his
dean, and finally confronts his philandering elderly father, the one-time king of American Literary Theory, at
an abandoned amusement park.

Such is the canvas of Richard Russo's Straight Man, a novel of surpassing wit, poignancy, and insight. As
he established in his previous books -- Mohawk, The Risk Pool, and Nobody's Fool -- Russo is unique
among contemporary authors for his ability to flawlessly capture the soul of the wise guy and the heart of a
difficult parent. In Hank Devereaux, Russo has created a hero whose humor and identification with the
absurd are mitigated only by his love for his family, friends, and, ultimately, knowledge itself.

Unforgettable, compassionate, and laugh-out-loud funny, Straight Man cements Richard Russo's reputation
as one of the master storytellers of our time.
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From reader reviews:

Valerie Hemming:

Book is to be different per grade. Book for children until adult are different content. As we know that book is
very important usually. The book Straight Man seemed to be making you to know about other expertise and
of course you can take more information. It is quite advantages for you. The e-book Straight Man is not only
giving you a lot more new information but also to become your friend when you feel bored. You can spend
your current spend time to read your book. Try to make relationship with the book Straight Man. You never
sense lose out for everything in case you read some books.

Lisa Martin:

This Straight Man are generally reliable for you who want to become a successful person, why. The key
reason why of this Straight Man can be one of the great books you must have is usually giving you more than
just simple reading food but feed you actually with information that might be will shock your preceding
knowledge. This book is definitely handy, you can bring it everywhere and whenever your conditions at e-
book and printed ones. Beside that this Straight Man giving you an enormous of experience for example rich
vocabulary, giving you test of critical thinking that could it useful in your day exercise. So , let's have it and
enjoy reading.

Marivel Tye:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind expertise or
thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are receiving problem with the book as compared to can
satisfy your limited time to read it because all of this time you only find e-book that need more time to be
examine. Straight Man can be your answer because it can be read by an individual who have those short free
time problems.

Michael Spicer:

You will get this Straight Man by visit the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it might to be
your solve trouble if you get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this guide are various. Not only by
means of written or printed but in addition can you enjoy this book by means of e-book. In the modern era
such as now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose
your ways to get more information about your e-book. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your
knowledge are still up-date. Let's try to choose suitable ways for you.
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