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A frightening, black-leather clad presence with a face like a skull--the half breed Scorpius--takes his villainy
to new heights.

"I long ago learned the advantages of patience."- Scorpius

A solo Scorpius graphic novel series, sure to excite and energize all of Farscape fandom! A frightening,
black-leather clad presence with a face like a skull--the half breed Scorpius--takes his villainy to new
heights. Crichton's worst adversary, fandom favorite villain, and one of science fictions greatest antagonists
finds himself deposed from his throne on Hyneria and making a bold new discovery that could put him back
on top of the Uncharted Territories! An excellent new entry point for Farscape fans that might have missed
the previous BOOM! Farscape graphic novels that have come before! Written by the FARSCAPE creator
Rockne S. O'Bannon and scripted by fan-favorite STAR TREK novelist David Alan Mack!
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From reader reviews:

Christopher Hairston:

Here thing why this specific Farscape: Scorpius Vol 1 are different and trustworthy to be yours. First of all
reading a book is good however it depends in the content of computer which is the content is as tasty as food
or not. Farscape: Scorpius Vol 1 giving you information deeper as different ways, you can find any guide out
there but there is no guide that similar with Farscape: Scorpius Vol 1. It gives you thrill studying journey, its
open up your eyes about the thing that will happened in the world which is probably can be happened around
you. It is easy to bring everywhere like in area, café, or even in your means home by train. If you are having
difficulties in bringing the branded book maybe the form of Farscape: Scorpius Vol 1 in e-book can be your
alternate.

Bill Dildy:

The particular book Farscape: Scorpius Vol 1 has a lot of knowledge on it. So when you make sure to read
this book you can get a lot of benefit. The book was compiled by the very famous author. The author makes
some research ahead of write this book. This specific book very easy to read you may get the point easily
after perusing this book.

Sandra Lester:

Beside this kind of Farscape: Scorpius Vol 1 in your phone, it can give you a way to get closer to the new
knowledge or details. The information and the knowledge you may got here is fresh through the oven so
don't be worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow town. It is good thing to have Farscape:
Scorpius Vol 1 because this book offers to you personally readable information. Do you oftentimes have
book but you rarely get what it's facts concerning. Oh come on, that won't happen if you have this inside
your hand. The Enjoyable set up here cannot be questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. So do you still
want to miss this? Find this book and also read it from currently!

Guadalupe McCoy:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information
originating from a book. Book is written or printed or illustrated from each source that will filled update of
news. In this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for a person. From
media social like newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic.
You can add your understanding by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to spread out your
book? Or just looking for the Farscape: Scorpius Vol 1 when you necessary it?
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