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Texas Ranger Andy Pickard, newly married and unsure of himself and his choice of career, is given what
appears to be a routine assignment: find and arrest a horse trader named Donley Bannister who is accused of
murder. The difficulty begins after Andy locates Bannister's West Texas hideout and is shot by one of the
trader's cohorts. In an ironic twist, Bannister saves the ranger's life by taking him to a cow camp where his
wound can be treated. Then Bannister disappears.

This routine assignment gets even more complicated after Andy heals well enough to ride and follows the
trader's young wife, hoping she will lead him to her husband. Near Fort Concho the ranger's mission is
interrupted when Bannister is shot and left for dead by an outlaw who takes Geneva Bannister hostage and
brutally assaults her.

Even after Bannister is apprehended, danger lurks; one of the trader's enemies is determined to ambush the
ranger and his prisoner.
From the experience, Andy Pickard learns a valuable lesson: nothing stirs emotions in Texas as men stealing
other men's horses.
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From reader reviews:

Adria Jenkins:

Reading a guide can be one of a lot of task that everyone in the world enjoys. Do you like reading book thus.
There are a lot of reasons why people fantastic. First reading a reserve will give you a lot of new details.
When you read a guide you will get new information because book is one of a number of ways to share the
information or perhaps their idea. Second, looking at a book will make anyone more imaginative. When you
examining a book especially hype book the author will bring you to definitely imagine the story how the
figures do it anything. Third, you could share your knowledge to some others. When you read this Other
Men's Horses (Texas Rangers), it is possible to tells your family, friends along with soon about yours book.
Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a e-book.

David Carson:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or perhaps go to the outside with them family
members or their friend. Do you realize? Many a lot of people spent they will free time just watching TV, or
maybe playing video games all day long. If you need to try to find a new activity honestly, that is look
different you can read some sort of book. It is really fun for you. If you enjoy the book that you simply read
you can spent the entire day to reading a guide. The book Other Men's Horses (Texas Rangers) it doesn't
matter what good to read. There are a lot of people who recommended this book. We were holding enjoying
reading this book. In the event you did not have enough space to deliver this book you can buy often the e-
book. You can m0ore easily to read this book from the smart phone. The price is not too expensive but this
book provides high quality.

Robert Wilkerson:

Is it you actually who having spare time in that case spend it whole day by watching television programs or
just laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Other Men's Horses (Texas Rangers) can be the
respond to, oh how comes? A fresh book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your extra time by
reading in this completely new era is common not a nerd activity. So what these books have than the others?

Robbie Lewis:

That book can make you to feel relax. This book Other Men's Horses (Texas Rangers) was multi-colored and
of course has pictures around. As we know that book Other Men's Horses (Texas Rangers) has many kinds
or category. Start from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or Investigator Conan you can read and
believe that you are the character on there. Therefore , not at all of book are make you bored, any it offers
you feel happy, fun and unwind. Try to choose the best book for you personally and try to like reading that.
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