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Daughter of the Forest, the first book in Juliet Marillier's award-winning Sevenwaters Trilogy

Lovely Sorcha is the seventh child and only daughter of Lord Colum of Sevenwaters. Bereft of a mother, she
is comforted by her six brothers who love and protect her. Sorcha is the light in their lives, they are
determined that she know only contentment.

But Sorcha's joy is shattered when her father is bewitched by his new wife, an evil enchantress who binds her
brothers with a terrible spell, a spell which only Sorcha can lift--by staying silent. If she speaks before she
completes the quest set to her by the Fair Folk and their queen, the Lady of the Forest, she will lose her
brothers forever.

When Sorcha is kidnapped by the enemies of Sevenwaters and taken to a foreign land, she is torn between
the desire to save her beloved brothers, and a love that comes only once. Sorcha despairs at ever being able
to complete her task, but the magic of the Fair Folk knows no boundaries, and love is the strongest magic of
them all...
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From reader reviews:

Floretta Simmons:

What do you think about book? It is just for students as they are still students or the item for all people in the
world, the particular best subject for that? Merely you can be answered for that problem above. Every person
has different personality and hobby for every other. Don't to be obligated someone or something that they
don't would like do that. You must know how great and also important the book Daughter of the Forest (The
Sevenwaters Trilogy, Book 1). All type of book could you see on many resources. You can look for the
internet solutions or other social media.

Rebecca Moreno:

The book untitled Daughter of the Forest (The Sevenwaters Trilogy, Book 1) is the book that recommended
to you to read. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown to you actually. The
language that creator use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The article writer was did a lot of
analysis when write the book, therefore the information that they share to you is absolutely accurate. You
also could get the e-book of Daughter of the Forest (The Sevenwaters Trilogy, Book 1) from the publisher to
make you much more enjoy free time.

Kellie Stephens:

Are you kind of busy person, only have 10 or perhaps 15 minute in your moment to upgrading your mind
talent or thinking skill actually analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book than can satisfy
your short space of time to read it because this all time you only find publication that need more time to be
study. Daughter of the Forest (The Sevenwaters Trilogy, Book 1) can be your answer because it can be read
by you who have those short extra time problems.

Karina McDermott:

Is it you actually who having spare time then spend it whole day by watching television programs or just
lying on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Daughter of the Forest (The Sevenwaters
Trilogy, Book 1) can be the reply, oh how comes? A book you know. You are so out of date, spending your
extra time by reading in this fresh era is common not a geek activity. So what these books have than the
others?
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