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For centuries, we've toyed with our creature companions, breeding dogs that herd and hunt, housecats that
look like tigers, and teacup pigs that fit snugly in our handbags. But what happens when we take animal
alteration a step further, engineering a cat that glows green under ultraviolet light or cloning the beloved
family Labrador? Science has given us a whole new toolbox for tinkering with life. How are we using it?

In Frankenstein's Cat, the journalist Emily Anthes takes us from petri dish to pet store as she explores how
biotechnology is shaping the future of our furry and feathered friends. As she ventures from bucolic
barnyards to a "frozen zoo" where scientists are storing DNA from the planet's most exotic creatures, she
discovers how we can use cloning to protect endangered species, craft prosthetics to save injured animals,
and employ genetic engineering to supply farms with disease-resistant livestock. Along the way, we meet
some of the animals that are ushering in this astonishing age of enhancement, including sensor-wearing seals,
cyborg beetles, a bionic bulldog, and the world's first cloned cat.

Through her encounters with scientists, conservationists, ethicists, and entrepreneurs, Anthes reveals that
while some of our interventions may be trivial (behold: the GloFish), others could improve the lives of many
species-including our own. So what does biotechnology really mean for the world's wild things? And what
do our brave new beasts tell us about ourselves?

With keen insight and her trademark spunk, Anthes highlights both the peril and the promise of our scientific
superpowers, taking us on an adventure into a world where our grandest science fiction fantasies are fast
becoming reality.
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From reader reviews:

Robin Boucher:

Have you spare time for a day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yeah, you can
choose the suitable activity with regard to spend your time. Any person spent their particular spare time to
take a go walking, shopping, or went to the particular Mall. How about open or read a book entitled
Frankenstein's Cat: Cuddling Up to Biotech's Brave New Beasts? Maybe it is to become best activity for you.
You realize beside you can spend your time along with your favorite's book, you can more intelligent than
before. Do you agree with it is opinion or you have different opinion?

Tony Valdez:

Do you certainly one of people who can't read pleasant if the sentence chained inside straightway, hold on
guys this kind of aren't like that. This Frankenstein's Cat: Cuddling Up to Biotech's Brave New Beasts book
is readable by simply you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for
enjoyable looking at experience without leaving even decrease the knowledge that want to give to you. The
writer involving Frankenstein's Cat: Cuddling Up to Biotech's Brave New Beasts content conveys objective
easily to understand by lots of people. The printed and e-book are not different in the written content but it
just different available as it. So , do you nevertheless thinking Frankenstein's Cat: Cuddling Up to Biotech's
Brave New Beasts is not loveable to be your top listing reading book?

Melvin Smith:

Reading a publication tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With studying you can get a lot of
information that could give you benefit in your life. Having book everyone in this world may share their
idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire all their reader with their story
or perhaps their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the textbooks. But also they write about the
knowledge about something that you need illustration. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
children, there are many kinds of book that you can get now. The authors nowadays always try to improve
their expertise in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write for their book. One of them is
this Frankenstein's Cat: Cuddling Up to Biotech's Brave New Beasts.

Valeria May:

People live in this new time of lifestyle always try and and must have the spare time or they will get great
deal of stress from both everyday life and work. So , once we ask do people have time, we will say
absolutely sure. People is human not really a huge robot. Then we question again, what kind of activity are
there when the spare time coming to you of course your answer will unlimited right. Then ever try this one,
reading textbooks. It can be your alternative throughout spending your spare time, often the book you have
read will be Frankenstein's Cat: Cuddling Up to Biotech's Brave New Beasts.
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