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This is a book about the life and experiences of Pat Morrell as a Realtor, and a real estate broker. On her long
journey she spent over fifty one years in the real estate industry as an active agent. She traveled through
many valleys and over many mountains, experiencing challenges, losses, and trying times. It required faith,
determination, and persistance. There were constant, new experiences, and changes in the "market", and the
paper work requirements. The book includes articles and poems Pat wrote that were published over the years
in the Real Toro, Real Estate Guide, and SACBOR by her real estate board. Some of the articles are
"motivational", and some are about the lives of realtors, including President's of her Board of Realtors. Her
book, "So You Want To Sell Real Estate" was started over thirty years ago, and never completed. Because of
other obligations, and life's challenges, it was filed away until just recently. Those pages are included in her
book, as well as other miscellaneous, inspirational, motivational, and thought provoking articles and poems.
The "survivor's" can take a trip down "memory lane", journeying" back through the years.
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From reader reviews:

Sylvia Dasilva:

Book is actually written, printed, or illustrated for everything. You can learn everything you want by a guide.
Book has a different type. As you may know that book is important factor to bring us around the world.
Beside that you can your reading ability was fluently. A guide My Journey As A Realtor will make you to
always be smarter. You can feel considerably more confidence if you can know about anything. But some of
you think that will open or reading some sort of book make you bored. It is not necessarily make you fun.
Why they may be thought like that? Have you trying to find best book or appropriate book with you?

Stephen Ziegler:

Typically the book My Journey As A Realtor will bring you to the new experience of reading a new book.
The author style to explain the idea is very unique. Should you try to find new book to see, this book very
suitable to you. The book My Journey As A Realtor is much recommended to you you just read. You can
also get the e-book from your official web site, so you can quickly to read the book.

John Folsom:

Reading a e-book tends to be new life style in this particular era globalization. With looking at you can get a
lot of information that will give you benefit in your life. Together with book everyone in this world could
share their idea. Publications can also inspire a lot of people. Plenty of author can inspire their reader with
their story or maybe their experience. Not only situation that share in the guides. But also they write about
advantage about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your children, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors these days always try to improve
their talent in writing, they also doing some exploration before they write to the book. One of them is this
My Journey As A Realtor.

Shawn Calvin:

Do you like reading a e-book? Confuse to looking for your best book? Or your book had been rare? Why so
many concern for the book? But any kind of people feel that they enjoy to get reading. Some people likes
looking at, not only science book and also novel and My Journey As A Realtor or maybe others sources were
given expertise for you. After you know how the truly amazing a book, you feel desire to read more and
more. Science e-book was created for teacher or even students especially. Those books are helping them to
add their knowledge. In various other case, beside science book, any other book likes My Journey As A
Realtor to make your spare time considerably more colorful. Many types of book like here.
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