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If you want to learn how to program, working with Python is an excellent way to start. This hands-on guide
takes you through the language one step at a time, beginning with basic programming concepts before
moving on to functions, recursion, data structures, and object-oriented design.

Through exercises in each chapter, you’ll try out programming concepts as you learn them. Think Python is
ideal for students at the high school or college level, as well as self-learners, home-schooled students, and
professionals who need to learn programming basics.

Start with the basics, including language syntax and semantics●

Get a clear definition of each programming concept●

Learn values, variables, statements, functions, and data structures in a logical progression●

Discover how to work with files and databases●

Understand objects, methods, and object-oriented programming●

Use debugging techniques to fix syntax, runtime, and semantic errors●

Explore interface design, data structures, and GUI-based programs through case studies●
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From reader reviews:

John Valdez:

In other case, little persons like to read book Think Python. You can choose the best book if you love reading
a book. Providing we know about how is important a book Think Python. You can add know-how and of
course you can around the world by a book. Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can realize
everything! From your country till foreign or abroad you will end up known. About simple thing until
wonderful thing you can know that. In this era, you can open a book or perhaps searching by internet device.
It is called e-book. You can use it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's learn.

Theresa Smith:

This Think Python book is not really ordinary book, you have it then the world is in your hands. The benefit
you obtain by reading this book will be information inside this e-book incredible fresh, you will get
information which is getting deeper an individual read a lot of information you will get. This Think Python
without we recognize teach the one who studying it become critical in imagining and analyzing. Don't
always be worry Think Python can bring if you are and not make your handbag space or bookshelves' turn
into full because you can have it in the lovely laptop even cellphone. This Think Python having good
arrangement in word along with layout, so you will not really feel uninterested in reading.

Mary McClellan:

This Think Python are reliable for you who want to be a successful person, why. The reason of this Think
Python can be on the list of great books you must have is usually giving you more than just simple
examining food but feed a person with information that perhaps will shock your previous knowledge. This
book is usually handy, you can bring it everywhere you go and whenever your conditions in the e-book and
printed types. Beside that this Think Python forcing you to have an enormous of experience like rich
vocabulary, giving you tryout of critical thinking that could it useful in your day activity. So , let's have it
appreciate reading.

Isabel Martin:

Is it anyone who having spare time after that spend it whole day through watching television programs or
just laying on the bed? Do you need something new? This Think Python can be the answer, oh how comes?
It's a book you know. You are and so out of date, spending your time by reading in this new era is common
not a geek activity. So what these textbooks have than the others?
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