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Julie Gold's Grammy-winning song "From a Distance" carries a message of hope in a troubled world that
touches a universal chord. It has been performed and recorded by many top artists, including Nanci Griffith,
Bette Midler, and the Byrds, and has been translated into several different languages. Now acclaimed
illustrator Jane Ray interprets this inspirational folk hymn with dazzling brilliance and keen sensitivity.

Through intricate watercolors, the illustrator constructs a story in which discord and disunity are
counterbalanced by a promise of peace and harmony. Her lush, distinctive folk-art style is ideally suited to
the spare poetic text that explores the space between the world as it should be--the untarnished creation--and
the world as it is--a place where war and injustice often prevail. The lavish illustrations paint an ultimately
joyous and life-affirming vision. The result is a book as moving and uplifting as the song itself.

With subject matter both timely and timeless--the expression of hope in a troubled world--and illustrations
universal and yet evocative of the recent ethnic wars in Eastern Europe, this beautiful book will be cherished
by people everywhere, young and old.
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From reader reviews:

Martha Wilson:

Do you considered one of people who can't read gratifying if the sentence chained in the straightway, hold
on guys this particular aren't like that. This From a Distance book is readable by means of you who hate the
straight word style. You will find the data here are arrange for enjoyable reading through experience without
leaving actually decrease the knowledge that want to give to you. The writer involving From a Distance
content conveys the thought easily to understand by many people. The printed and e-book are not different in
the content but it just different as it. So , do you even now thinking From a Distance is not loveable to be
your top collection reading book?

Randal Revilla:

Hey guys, do you desires to finds a new book to study? May be the book with the title From a Distance
suitable to you? Typically the book was written by famous writer in this era. The actual book untitled From a
Distanceis the one of several books in which everyone read now. This kind of book was inspired a number of
people in the world. When you read this publication you will enter the new shape that you ever know before.
The author explained their idea in the simple way, therefore all of people can easily to understand the core of
this e-book. This book will give you a wide range of information about this world now. To help you see the
represented of the world on this book.

Harriette Corwin:

Typically the book From a Distance has a lot info on it. So when you check out this book you can get a lot of
advantage. The book was authored by the very famous author. This articles author makes some research just
before write this book. This particular book very easy to read you can obtain the point easily after reading
this article book.

Phillis Ries:

Guide is one of source of information. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen have to have book to know the revise information of year in order to year. As we know
those textbooks have many advantages. Beside most of us add our knowledge, also can bring us to around
the world. With the book From a Distance we can acquire more advantage. Don't that you be creative
people? Being creative person must want to read a book. Simply choose the best book that acceptable with
your aim. Don't possibly be doubt to change your life with that book From a Distance. You can more
attractive than now.
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