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As a student moves from basic calculus courses into upper-division courses in linear and abstract algebra,
real and complex analysis, number theory, topology, and so on, a "bridge" course can help ensure a smooth
transition. Introduction to Mathematical Structures and Proofs is a textbook intended for such a course, or for
self-study.  This book introduces an array of fundamental mathematical structures. It also explores the
delicate balance of intuition and rigor—and the flexible thinking—required to prove a nontrivial result.  In
short, this book seeks to enhance the mathematical maturity of the reader.

The new material in this second edition includes a section on graph theory, several new sections on number
theory (including primitive roots, with an application to card-shuffling), and a brief introduction to the
complex numbers (including a section on the arithmetic of the Gaussian integers). Solutions for even
numbered exercises are available on springer.com for instructors adopting the text for a course.

From a review of the first edition:

"...Gerstein wants—very gently—to teach his students to think. He wants to show them how to wrestle with
a problem (one that is more sophisticated than "plug and chug"), how to build a solution, and ultimately he
wants to teach the students to take a statement and develop a way to prove it...Gerstein writes with a certain
flair that I think students will find appealing. ...I am confident that a student who works through Gerstein's
book will really come away with (i) some mathematical technique, and (ii) some mathematical knowledge….

Gerstein’s book states quite plainly that the text is designed for use in a transitions course.  Nothing benefits
a textbook author more than having his goals clearly in mind, and Gerstein’s book achieves its goals.  I
would be happy to use it in a transitions course.”

—Steven Krantz, American Mathematical Monthly
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From reader reviews:

Natasha Rich:

Now a day folks who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by connect with the internet and the
resources within it can be true or not require people to be aware of each data they get. How many people to
be smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Reading a book
can help individuals out of this uncertainty Information specially this Introduction to Mathematical
Structures and Proofs (Undergraduate Texts in Mathematics) book because this book offers you rich info and
knowledge. Of course the data in this book hundred pct guarantees there is no doubt in it you probably know
this.

Joel Faulkner:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The e-book lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, brief story and the biggest the first is novel. Now, why not attempting Introduction to Mathematical
Structures and Proofs (Undergraduate Texts in Mathematics) that give your entertainment preference will be
satisfied by reading this book. Reading behavior all over the world can be said as the method for people to
know world a great deal better then how they react toward the world. It can't be explained constantly that
reading behavior only for the geeky person but for all of you who wants to be success person. So , for all of
you who want to start reading through as your good habit, you could pick Introduction to Mathematical
Structures and Proofs (Undergraduate Texts in Mathematics) become your personal starter.

Sara Burns:

This Introduction to Mathematical Structures and Proofs (Undergraduate Texts in Mathematics) is new way
for you who has curiosity to look for some information since it relief your hunger details. Getting deeper you
into it getting knowledge more you know or perhaps you who still having small amount of digest in reading
this Introduction to Mathematical Structures and Proofs (Undergraduate Texts in Mathematics) can be the
light food to suit your needs because the information inside this kind of book is easy to get through anyone.
These books build itself in the form that is reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book web form. People
who think that in guide form make them feel drowsy even dizzy this book is the answer. So there is not any
in reading a guide especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for anyone. So ,
don't miss that! Just read this e-book variety for your better life and knowledge.

Raul Miller:

A lot of reserve has printed but it differs. You can get it by internet on social media. You can choose the best
book for you, science, comedy, novel, or whatever through searching from it. It is identified as of book
Introduction to Mathematical Structures and Proofs (Undergraduate Texts in Mathematics). You can add
your knowledge by it. Without causing the printed book, it could add your knowledge and make an
individual happier to read. It is most essential that, you must aware about e-book. It can bring you from one



location to other place.
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