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Nothing like the wheel exists in nature; it may be one of humanity's greatest inventions. In Wheels, writer
and illustrator Edwin Tunis traces the development of the wheel over 5,000 years, his accurate drawings and
lucid text depicting the human victory over space and inertia. Beginning with the first primitive form of
wheel -- the captive roller -- Tunis takes readers through the history of land transportation from the Elamite
chariot -- the first recorded passenger chariot -- to the ancient wheeled vehicles of the Egyptians, Assyrians,
Greeks, Persians, Romans, Chinese, and Indians; the whirlicotes, carrosses, berlines, fiacres, and phaetons
that traveled the roads of Europe from the Middle Ages to the Industrial Age; the Conestoga wagons, prairie
schooners, and Concord coaches that carried Americans westward; the velocipede, the world's first bicycle,
and its successor, the penny-farthing; steam-powered wheeled carriages like the Dudgeon and La Mancelle;
Karl Benz's 1885 gasoline tricycle and the 1896 Ford quadricycle; the roadsters of the Jazz Age; and the
gloriously chromed and tail-finned sedans of the 1950s.

The history of the wheel is the story of civilization, and in Wheels -- which won the Boy's Club of America's
Gold Medal when it was first published in 1955 -- Tunis tells it with wit and illustrates it with striking
drawings that will delight readers of all ages.
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From reader reviews:

Craig Baker:

This Wheels: A Pictorial History are usually reliable for you who want to be described as a successful
person, why. The main reason of this Wheels: A Pictorial History can be one of the great books you must
have is actually giving you more than just simple reading through food but feed a person with information
that perhaps will shock your prior knowledge. This book is definitely handy, you can bring it just about
everywhere and whenever your conditions throughout the e-book and printed people. Beside that this
Wheels: A Pictorial History giving you an enormous of experience such as rich vocabulary, giving you trial
of critical thinking that we all know it useful in your day pastime. So , let's have it appreciate reading.

Robert Hollinger:

The actual book Wheels: A Pictorial History has a lot associated with on it. So when you check out this book
you can get a lot of profit. The book was written by the very famous author. The author makes some research
prior to write this book. This book very easy to read you will get the point easily after scanning this book.

Ralph Capra:

This Wheels: A Pictorial History is great guide for you because the content which is full of information for
you who have always deal with world and still have to make decision every minute. This kind of book reveal
it info accurately using great arrange word or we can claim no rambling sentences inside it. So if you are
read it hurriedly you can have whole details in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you straight forward sentences
but tricky core information with lovely delivering sentences. Having Wheels: A Pictorial History in your
hand like keeping the world in your arm, information in it is not ridiculous one particular. We can say that no
publication that offer you world inside ten or fifteen minute right but this guide already do that. So , this is
good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs. active do you still doubt which?

John Sorrells:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to obtain information. The information will make you to
definitely understand the condition of the world. The healthiness of the world makes the information simpler
to share. You can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, magazine, book, and soon. You
can see that now, a lot of publisher in which print many kinds of book. Often the book that recommended to
you is Wheels: A Pictorial History this reserve consist a lot of the information of the condition of this world
now. This specific book was represented how can the world has grown up. The terminology styles that writer
make usage of to explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some research when he makes this book.
That is why this book acceptable all of you.
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