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Join Rider and the Pups Investigators Pack in their second silly mystery about a fishy impostor.

Rider Woofson is the best dog detective in Pawston, maybe even in the whole world! His job is to protect the
city and its citizens from the dangerous criminal underbelly. So when Prince Bubbles—a reclusive but
friendly prince—visits Pawston from the underwater country of New Sealand, Rider and the PI pack receive
a tip that the prince is an impostor and spring into action.

With another purr-fect mystery on their paws, Rider and the PI pack set out on an exciting investigation to
uncover the truth about their royal visitor.

With easy-to-read language and illustrations on almost every page, the Rider Woofson chapter books are
perfect for beginning readers!
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From reader reviews:

Manuel Rodriguez:

This Something Smells Fishy (Rider Woofson Book 2) tend to be reliable for you who want to certainly be a
successful person, why. The key reason why of this Something Smells Fishy (Rider Woofson Book 2) can be
among the great books you must have is giving you more than just simple reading food but feed you actually
with information that possibly will shock your previous knowledge. This book is actually handy, you can
bring it everywhere you go and whenever your conditions at e-book and printed kinds. Beside that this
Something Smells Fishy (Rider Woofson Book 2) forcing you to have an enormous of experience for
instance rich vocabulary, giving you tryout of critical thinking that we understand it useful in your day task.
So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

Edward McCain:

Often the book Something Smells Fishy (Rider Woofson Book 2) has a lot associated with on it. So when
you make sure to read this book you can get a lot of profit. The book was compiled by the very famous
author. Mcdougal makes some research previous to write this book. This book very easy to read you can find
the point easily after perusing this book.

Rodney Hussey:

Do you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store? Make
an effort to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't judge book by its cover may doesn't
work is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in the
outside look likes. Maybe you answer could be Something Smells Fishy (Rider Woofson Book 2) why
because the excellent cover that make you consider with regards to the content will not disappoint you. The
inside or content is fantastic as the outside or even cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly direct you to
pick up this book.

Eugene Hughes:

Many people spending their moment by playing outside having friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by looking at a book. Ugh,
ya think reading a book can actually hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It fine you can
have the e-book, bringing everywhere you want in your Touch screen phone. Like Something Smells Fishy
(Rider Woofson Book 2) which is getting the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's see.
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