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Selected by the Modern Library as one of the 100 best novels of all time

Set amid the splendor of London drawing rooms and gilded Venetian palazzos, The Wings of the Dove is
the story of Milly Theale, a naïve, doomed American heiress, and a pair of lovers, Kate Croy and Merton
Densher, who conspire to obtain her fortune. In this witty tragedy of treachery, self-deception, and betrayal,
Henry James weaves together three ill-fated and wholly human destinies unexpectedly linked by desire,
greed, and salvation. As Amy Bloom writes in her Introduction, “The Wings of the Dove is a novel of
intimacy. . . . [James] gives us passion, he gives us love in its terrible and enchanting forms.”
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From reader reviews:

John Lee:

Spent a free time for you to be fun activity to accomplish! A lot of people spent their down time with their
family, or their own friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, planning to beach, or
picnic inside park. They actually doing same task every week. Do you feel it? Would you like to something
different to fill your own personal free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book might be option to fill your
free of charge time/ holiday. The first thing that you'll ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read.
If you want to attempt look for book, may be the reserve untitled The Wings of the Dove (Modern Library
100 Best Novels) can be excellent book to read. May be it is usually best activity to you.

Daniel Trimble:

The book untitled The Wings of the Dove (Modern Library 100 Best Novels) contain a lot of information on
it. The writer explains her idea with easy technique. The language is very clear to see all the people, so do
not necessarily worry, you can easy to read it. The book was authored by famous author. The author brings
you in the new time of literary works. You can easily read this book because you can keep reading your
smart phone, or model, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the
e-book, you can wide open their official web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice study.

Wilma Tovar:

In this era globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make anyone
to understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information much easier to
share. You can find a lot of personal references to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and
soon. You can view that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The particular book that
recommended for you is The Wings of the Dove (Modern Library 100 Best Novels) this guide consist a lot
of the information in the condition of this world now. This book was represented just how can the world has
grown up. The vocabulary styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer
made some exploration when he makes this book. That's why this book suited all of you.

Timothy Quintero:

A lot of book has printed but it takes a different approach. You can get it by web on social media. You can
choose the best book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by simply searching from it. It is referred to
as of book The Wings of the Dove (Modern Library 100 Best Novels). You can include your knowledge by
it. Without leaving the printed book, it might add your knowledge and make you happier to read. It is most
critical that, you must aware about book. It can bring you from one spot to other place.
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